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Human rights and equity in 
mental health services
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School of Health Policy and Management 
in the Faculty of Health at York University. 
She uses critical mental health and inter-

sectional approaches in her work to better 
understand the social, political, and insti-
tutional processes through which health 
and mental health policies and practices 

are developed and how social and health 
inequities are sustained or attenuated for 

different populations. Marina strongly 
supports public scholarship and the work 
and activism of the Mad movement and 
Mad scholars. Marina is the lead editor 
(with Dr. Halinka Malcoe) of Critical In-

quiries for Social Justice in Mental Health 
(University of Toronto Press, 2017).

Evidence abounds of the discrimina-
tion, stigma, and human rights viola-

tions experienced by people who access 
mental health care, and yet the system’s 
response to this evidence has been poor. 
Rights violations and coercive practices 
in mental health care are evident in dis-
criminatory behaviours, stigmatizing atti-
tudes, and the implementation of mental 
health laws (Brophy et al., 2018; Newton-
Howes & Ryan, 2017; Newton-Howes, 
2019; Pũras, 2017). The Canadian Char-
ter of Rights and Freedoms upholds the 
right to life, liberty, and security, and is 
meant to protect Canadians from cruel 
and unusual punishment (1982, s. 7). 
Canada is also a signatory to the UN Con-
vention on the Rights of People with Dis-
abilities (UNCRPD), and yet many of the 
routine practices in mental health care 
violate both the Charter and the Con-
vention (Pũras, 2017, 2018). These prac-
tices exist despite a global push toward 
recovery and human rights – oriented par-
adigms in mental health (Mental Health 
Commission of Canada [MHCC], 2009, 
2012; World Health Organization [WHO], 
n.d.). This article provides an overview of 
these tensions and the current silences 
surrounding human rights in the Canad-
ian mental health policy context, and 
highlights examples of resistive strategies 
and community-based initiatives that give 
primacy to people’s lived experiences.

MENTAL HEALTH, HUMAN 
RIGHTS, AND SOCIAL JUSTICE
The Canadian mental health care sys-
tem has often been referred to as a two-
tiered system, or as one of “the orphan 
children” of medicare (Romanow, 2002, 
p.  178). From the inception of medi-
care, key players like the Canadian Men-
tal Health Association (CMHA) and, 
indeed, Tommy Douglas himself sup-
ported the idea that medicare should 
include coverage for mental health. 
Regrettably, political jockeying ultim-
ately resulted in medicare covering only 

medicalized services, including psychia-
try, and, in the case of severe illness, a 
variety of community-based support sys-
tems that remain difficult to access and 
that by all accounts are fragmented and 
poorly coordinated (Marchildon, 2011; 
Kirby & Keon, 2006; Flood & Thomas, 
2017). Meanwhile, those with money 
can access private psychological services 
and a range of mental health supporting 
resources like housing, good nutrition, 
access to recreation, and other wellness-
related goods. This funding arrangement 
means that mental health is primar-
ily defined in medical terms, a fact that 
structurally and ideologically limits the 
ability of governments to respond to the 
wide range of social needs that under-
mine mental well-being. Effectively, the 
Canadian mental health care system sees 
the social and structural determinants of 

mental health as secondary to the bio-
logical and genetic causes of mental dis-
tress, despite there being little scientific 
evidence to support this unidimensional 
understanding of mental health (Malla 
et al., 2015).

Human rights abuses and coercion 
arise from an entrenched belief that 
people suffering from mental illness and 
distress (especially as manifested in psy-
chosis or forms of socially unacceptable 
behaviour) are incapable of making deci-
sions about their needs. That is, people 
suffering from mental illness and dis-
tress are assumed to lack insight into 
their own condition, and therefore the 
state must step in to constrain and treat 
them. While most would acknowledge 
that there are situations in which people 
may pose a risk of harm to themselves 
or others, the current method of con-
straining and forcibly treating people is a 
blunt instrument for dealing with a com-
plex and nuanced human problem. Men-
tal health laws that allow for committal 
and forced treatment function through 
the mechanism of mandatory detention 
(Reilly et al., 2018). Compliance with 
mandatory detention and subsequent 
treatment is often enforced through inter-
disciplinary mental health care teams in 
coordination with police. The grounds 
on which mandatory detention orders 
can be issued vary from region to region, 
but orders are generally based on risk 
assessments of harm “to self or others.” 
While it is recognized that domestic 
mental health laws operate in contraven-
tion of the UNCRPD1 (Pũras, 2017, 2018; 
Hoffman et al., 2016), there has been lit-
tle political will to bring domestic laws in 
line with international law.

Besides mandatory detention orders, 
other potentially damaging practices 
continue to proliferate, including the use 
of seclusion and restraints in hospitals, 
electroconvulsive therapy (ECT), and 
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stigma and discrimination that result in 
real harms and deter access to supports 
(Brophy et al., 2016; Milne & Williams, 
2000). Discrimination based on gender, 
racialization, citizenship, and coloniz-
ation interacts with mental illness, and 
thus certain populations are dispropor-
tionately impacted by these practices 
and by mental health human rights viola-
tions (Halinka Malcoe & Morrow, 2017). 
For example, men who are racialized, 
migrant, and Indigenous are more likely 
to be issued mandatory detention orders 
(Van Veen et al., 2018) and to be sub-
ject to coercive practices such as isola-
tion rooms and physical and chemical 
restraints (Singh et al., 2007). Treatments 
that have proved damaging to the brain 
such as ECT are used more frequently on 
older women (Milne & Williams, 2000).

EXPLORING TENSIONS AND 
SILENCES
Countering discrimination and human 
rights violations in mental health care 
is the ongoing quest for more just and 
equitable mental health services both 
in Canada and internationally (Friedli, 
2009; WHO, n.d.). Sweeping Canadian 
mental health care reforms since the 
1960s have shifted the focus from institu-
tional care to the provision of care in the 
community and have shifted the care par-
adigm from a custodial model to a model 
in which care is user-driven and enacts 
the recovery principles of autonomy and 
choice (MHCC, 2009, 2012; Mulvale et al., 
2007). Recovery as a philosophy of care 
is rooted both in the activism of people 
with lived experiences of psychiatric 
institutionalization (e.g., Deegan, 1988) 
and in professional practice (Cleary & 
Dowling, 2009; Davidson et al., 2011). 
Recovery posits that, regardless of peo-
ple’s limitations due to illness, all people 
can live meaningful lives if they are free 
from stigma and discrimination and are 
able to access care and supports that 
foster self-determination (MHCC, 2012; 
Onken et al., 2007). Moreover, the recov-
ery movement calls attention to the 
larger social and systemic issues facing 

people, including discrimination and the 
need for economic security (see Jacob-
son & Farah, 2012; O’Hagan, 2004).

Arguably, neoliberal policy and dis-
cursive regimes have co-opted recovery, 
reducing it from a powerful psychiatric 
survivor political movement to an individ-
ualistic approach that largely ignores the 
social and structural factors that impact 
people’s lives (Morrow, 2013; Morrow 
& Weisser, 2012). Dramatic cuts to the 
social welfare state and the entrench-
ment of reductionist business models in 
mental health services have meant that 
discussions of rights and discrimination 
are largely absent in Canadian mental 
health policy. Indeed, in a climate of scar-
city of supports, the loss of rights is often 
silently taken for granted as a prerequisite 
for accessing mental health care.

While the tensions between care and 
control as manifested in services have 
been much remarked on (e.g., Morrow 
et  al., 2008), little progress has been 
made in reconciling these tensions, and 
indeed current policy responses trend 
toward social control. For example, the 
increasingly widespread integration of 
police into mental health care is result-
ing in new forms of surveillance and con-
tainment (Van Veen et al., 2018).

COUNTERNARRATIVES AND 
RESISTIVE PRACTICES
Activists have raised concerns about 
forced treatment, isolation, and restraints 
since the early days of deinstitutionaliza-
tion, often using first-person narratives of 
the impact of these experiences (Shim-
rit, 1997; Capponi, 1992, 2003). Commu-
nity-based organizations that are led or 
informed by psychiatric survivors are 
also sites of resistance, offering models 
of support that are non-medical and non-
coercive and educating people about 
their rights (e.g., the Gerstein Crisis Cen-
tre in Toronto and the West Coast Mental 
Health Network in Vancouver). Activists 
have also challenged the Canadian gov-
ernment to bring its domestic mental 
health laws into full compliance with the 
UNCRPD (Crawford et al., 2019) and have 

launched lawsuits against provincial men-
tal health statutes (e.g., Council of Canad-
ians with Disabilities, 2016). Researcher 
partnerships that give primacy to the 
knowledge and experience of psychiatric 
survivors are also playing a role in build-
ing an evidence base that supports equity 
and human-rights-informed care (Morrow 
et al., 2020). While resistance is strong, it 
is not well coordinated, and supports are 
needed to sustain concerted pressure on 
the Canadian government to recognize 
the depth of the harms caused by ser-
vices that violate human rights and basic 
human dignity. 

NOTES
1. When Canada ratified the UNCRPD in 

2010, it reserved the right to retain 
substitute decision making, which 
allows for detainment under provincial 
mental health statutes.
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nurse/social worker/police officer model 
(Toronto Neighbourhood Centres, 2021). 
Given the notable increase in police bru-
tality and violence, which has especially 
affected marginalized groups and those 
with mental health issues, this project is 
not only timely but also a necessary activ-
ist response to the call to abolish carceral 
and punitive forms of justice.

The consequences of biomedical psy-
chiatric hegemony in the health profes-
sions are both far-reaching and highly 
problematic for society. The reproduc-
tion of biomedical psychiatry through the 
cognate disciplines will continue to lead 
to violent and, at best, highly problem-
atic practices aimed at “helping” while 
often producing the very opposite result. 
While the current evidence of the pro-
fuse medicalization of mental health in 
nursing education is rather clear (Adam, 
2017; Adam et al., 2019; Adam & Juer-
gensen, 2019), my hope is that the con-
tributions of these projects, and my work 
more generally, will fuel the global psy-

chiatric abolitionist movement and help 
to create more community-based alterna-
tives to psychiatry. 
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