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any significant effect on the Quebec
electorate. Three consecutive polls
recently have indicated a great deal
of support for the Quebec govern­
ment's initiative.

The federalists' great discomfort
has led them to a hastily hatched
plan to boycott the consultations
that the government will be holding
this yearinFebruary and March. For
many sovereigntists, as recent polls
show, this attitude is neither con­
structive nor wise and most prob­
ably underlies the fact that federal­
ists in Quebec have very little to say
about the political future ofQuebec.
As Mr. Parizeau put it in the Na­
tional Assembly, their boycott is a
pretext, a "faux-fuyant" for not par­
ticipating and for preferring to hide
their heads in the sand on this issue
and promote the status quo as they
have been doing since the rejection
of the Charlottetown accord in Oc­
tober 1992. The Quebec Liberal
party would also find itself in the
embarrassing position of having to
object to many components of the

draft bill on sovereignty that they
have, in recent history, endorsed.
For example, its leaders signed the
Bilanger-Campeau Report and
voted on the ensuing act, both of
which constitute large components
of the sovereigntist agenda of the
new Quebec government.

Promoters of the status quo may
sit on the sidelines and continue to
question the legitimacy of the proc­
ess or contemplate a parallel proc­
ess to denigrate the sovereigntist
option. Meanwhile, the Quebec gov­
ernment will be calling on the com­
mon sense of Quebeckers, confi­
dent oftheir capacity to debate posi­
tively the main features of a future
sovereign Quebec and involving
them in a truly democratic process.
This process will certainly lead to a
better understanding of all the di­
mensions of sovereignty; will shed
light on the economic, social, and
cultural aspects of the sovereigntist
agenda; and prepare Quebeckers to
make an informed choice on Que­
bec's accession to sovereignty.
Quebeckers will participate fully
and, one can predict, enthusiasti-

cally in a very significant debate
that the democratically elected gov­
ernment of Quebec has a clear man­
date and responsibility to initiate
before calling on the people to make
the fundamental choice in a referen­
dum on sovereignty.

And, moreover, Quebeckers will
witness the solidarity of the
sovereigntist forces, of the Parti
quebecois and the Bloc quebecois,
who have closely linked their or­
ganizations, and that together with
their other partners outside the parti­
san political sphere will propose a
clear sense of direction to
Quebeckers. Togetherthey will show
that the sovereigntist option is not
only legitimate and feasible, but also
the best choice for Quebec's future,
an option that will incorporate all the
most positive aspects of modern
democratic values, as we will see
during the upcoming debate on the
draft bill on Quebec sovereignty.

Daniel Turp is a professor in the

Faculty ofLaw, Universite de
Montreal and President ofthe Policy

Committee ofthe Bloc quebecois. •
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CANADA'S POLITICS OF CATHARSIS
by Jamie Cameron

THE POLITICS OF CATHARSIS

The year 1995 finds Canada in the
grip of catharsis. There has already
been an international run on the
Canadian dollar and momentum is
building toward Quebec's separa­
tion referendum. Under the watch­
ful eye of full diplomatic alert, Pre­
mier Parizeau sought a sympathetic
hearing for Quebec independence in
France. The Bloc quebecois has
asked to meet with PresidentClinton
during his visit to Ottawa. Mean-
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while, with the federal government
maintaining a determined silence,
thedefenceofCanadahas beentaken
up by those who are equally deter­
mined that this nation should not
"go gentle into that good night."

Quebec's separation referendum
is presented to the rest of Canada as
a simple exercise in democracy. It
takes place against a backdrop of
numerous failed exercises in demo­
cratic constitutional reform. In the
circumstances, it is hardly surpris-

ing that Canadians everywhere are
confused.

The referendum is Quebec's re­
sponse to Canada's 1982 patriation
and reform ofthe Constitution. With
nine of ten provinces signing on, the
patriationofthe Constitution in 1982
might have seemed democratic
enough. Except that, rightly or
wrongly, the province of Quebec
withheld its consent. Hence· the
"moral case for secession" (see
Laforest's article in this issue).
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The Meech Lake accord at­
tempted to bring Quebec back into
Canada's "constitutional family"
through friendly amendments to the
Constitution. Though all of Cana­
da's democratically elected federal
and provincial leaders supported it
in 1987, by 1990 the accord would
be robbed of all democratic legiti­
macy and would suffer a noisy and
ignominious demise.

Then came the Charlottetown
accord of 1992, an exercise in de­
mocracy run amok. There was some­
thing for everyone in the accord, and
citizens voted on it in a nation-wide
referendum. Though democratic
participation was vindicated, the
politics of inclusion resulted in yet
another cataclysmic failure of con­
stitutional reform.

Now Canada faces another exer­
cise in democratic reform: this time,
one part of the country claims to
bind the others through the "moral
force" of a vote for separation.

Such a prospect exposes deep
conflicts and questions about the
foundations ofCanadian democracy.
If Quebec votes "yes," in what cir­
cumstances, if any, does the rest of
Canada have a moral obligation to
respect that result? And what of the
discrete pockets ofQuebeckers who
have announced their opposition to
separation? Can a majority of
Quebeckers claim a democratic pre­
rogative for themselves that would
then be denied to those pockets of
aboriginals and anglophone/
allophones? To complicate matters,
the Inuit have announced their in­
tention to conduct a referendum.
Which result will have a greater
moral claim on the rest of Canada,
and why?

Few pretend to know the answers
to any, much less all, of those ques­
tions. However, defining what we
mean by democracy in the upcoming
months is not an abstract exercise; it
is one fraught with consequences
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for the future. As the process un­
folds, new questions are moving to
the fore: how will the question be
phrased? whose debate is this, and
whose voices should be heard?
should the rest of Canada partici­
pate in the debate on Quebec separa­
tion?

THE "INCIDENTAL MISCffiEFS"

OF FREE DISCUSSION

In 1938, the chief justice of
Canada declared, "notwithstanding
its incidental mischiefs," that "free
discussion of public affairs" is "the
breath of life for parliamentary in­
stitutions." Though much has
changed, the riddle of free public
discussion remains.

"Quebec's separation
referendum is presented to the

rest of Canada as a simple
exercise in democracy. ... In

the circumstances, it is hardly
surprising that Canadians
everywhere are confused."

The question of who is free to
discuss Quebec separation, and on
what terms, has become a central
aspect of Canada's catharsis.

In Quebec, one of the PQ's own
consultants, Pierre Bourgault, was
removed following remarks directed
at non-francophone communities
opposed to separation, which were
widely described as ominous and
threatening. A conception of sepa­
ration as an exercise in raw
majoritarian power was quickly ex­
cised from public discourse. More
recently, allegations have been made
that the PQ government has at­
tempted to make Radio-Quebec, a
publicly-owned and independent
broadcaster in the province, an in­
strument of separation.

Meanwhile, the rest of Canada,
which quietly worried last fall dur­
ing Quebec's provincial election
campaign, has now entered the de-

bate, thereby dramatically raising
the stakes. Prominentamong its par­
ticipants is Patrick Monahan (see
his article in this issue), who claims
that a "yes" vote would be so disas­
sembling that the prospects of Que­
bec separation being successfully
negotiatedare virtuallynil. Quebeck­
ers have described his CoolerHeads
study as an exercise in terrorism and
scare-mongering. Monahan' s inter­
vention has brought the conflict be­
tween Quebec separatists and Ca­
nadian federalists into sharp focus
(see Latouche Is article in this issue),
and exposed divisions among com­
mentators outside Quebec (see
Hutchinson's article in this issue).

Nor is it quiet on the international
front. After casual remarks about
Canadian federalism caused a dip­
lomatic stir, members ofParliament
in the British House of Commons
learned that they must henceforth
practise a little self-restraint.
Freighted with far more significance
was Premier Parizeau's visit to
France as head-of-state-in-waiting.
Every step and word ofthis visit was
carefully monitored by the Cana­
dian government, as well as by the
PQ and Canadian press.

The debate in upcoming months
holds consequences for all of
Canada. Precisely for that reason, it
is important, whatever the future
may bring, that debate on Quebec
separation be conducted in an envi­
ronment of free public discussion,
incidental mischiefs and all.

COOLER BEADS

However, with the rising tensions
of recent weeks, calls have been
made for "cooler heads" to prevail.
Unfortunately, there is little agree­
ment as to what "cooler heads"
would do in these circumstances.

Mr. Parizeau's version of cooler
heads implores us to "hold our

Continued, see "Politics of
Catharsis" on page 50.
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THE MORAL CASE FOR SECESSlON"Politics ofCatharsis"
continued from page 49.

horses" and remember that it is in
Canada's self-interest to respect
Quebec's exercise in democracy­
he believes that if the rest ofCanada
would behave rationally, then sepa­
ration could be smoothly and ami­
cably negotiated. To Professor
Monahan, creator of this curiously
Canadian aspiration, "coolerheads"
means something quite different. In
his view, it is precisely because the
costs of separation will be so great
that coolerheads within Quebec will
realize, as a matter of their rational
self-interest, that the game is not
worth the candle.

Surely the arctic constraints of a
"cooler heads" discourse cannot be
imposed on a debate that promises
to be hot as hell. Canadians inside
and outside Quebec are far more
likely, in the words of our as yet
silent prime minister, to speak
"straight from the heart."

Fasten your seat belts-it could
be a bumpy ride.

Jamie Cameron is Director ofthe
Centre for Public Law and Public
Policy, and Associate Professor at
Osgoode Hall Law School. •
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so

by Guy Laforest

Why should Quebec want to se­
cede? What are its moral reasons?
Isn't Canada already the most de­
centralized federation in the world,
and the best country in the world
according to the United Nations?
Isn't it clear, as David Cameron
insisted recently in Canada Watch
(NovemberfDecember 1994), that
Quebeckers enjoy liberal individual
rights and that Canada is a truly
democratic state? Are we not wit­
nessing the hijacking of the whole
citizenry of Quebec by the small,
only 2,000-people strong (to bor­
row a figure from Laurier Lapierre),
nationalist elite? These are huge
questions. I shall try to give at least
the contours of a reply to the first
two questions, those concerning the
morality of sovereignty and
secession.

FEDERALISM AND POLITICAL

COMMUNITY

Donald Smiley had gained a great
reputation as one of the most emi­
nent scholars of the century on Ca­
nadian federalism. When his stu­
dents and his peers decided to hon­
our the York University professor
with a collection of articles, it was
not by accident that they entitled it
Federalism and Political Commu­
nity. Smiley knew all too well what
was proper to do to one's fellow
compatriots in a truly federal pOliti­
cal community. To say that he con­
sidered improper what Canada did
to Quebec in 1982, when the consti­
tution was patriated, would be a
remarkable understatement. As he
put it,

... anexercise inconstitutional
review and reform [aimed at]
... more harmonious relations
between Quebec and the wider
Canadian community has [in-

stead] involved a betrayal of
the Quebec electorate, a breach
of fundamental constitutional
convention, a recrudescence of
Quebec nationalism, and an
even more serious Quebec
challenge than before to the
legitimacy of the Canadian
constitutional order.

Smiley's title, "A Dangerous
Deed," and the title of the book in
which this particular piece appears,
And No One Cheered, are delight­
fully anachronistic. From Smiley we
receive a crucial insight: it is plausi­
ble to argue that a major breach of
federal trust occurred in 1981 - 1982
when the powers of Quebec were
reduced without its consent. A fed­
eral community is governed by moral
rules: the required consent of the
constituent units when changes re­
duce their legislative prerogatives is
one of those rules. Actually, it may
be the most important one. My
former mentor at McGill , James
Tully, uses the following expres­
sion to refer to that rule, or conven­
tion, of federal morality: "What
touches all must be approved by
all." (In Latin, quad omnes tangit.)
(SeeJames Tully, "Diversity's Gam­
bitDeclined," in Curtis Cook, Cana­
da's Constitutional Predicament
After 1992.)

THE ARK AND THE COVENANT

Donald Smiley was not content
to criticize the way in which
patriation was achieved. Afew years
later he went on to argue that Cana­
da's official language policies, en­
shrined in the Charter ofRights and
Freedoms, were "absurd." This, de­
spite the remarkable progress in
English-speaking Canada of what
Peter Russell calls "Charter patriot­
ism." Through the Charter ofRights
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